

Bid for Year 2020

City of Huron
Huron, South Dakota

Bid Tabulation Sheet

Bid No. 2020-05

Water Treatment Chemicals Feb. 1,2020 - Dec. 31, 2020

February 3, 2020

Bidder			Hawkins Inc. bids@hawkinsInc.com 2381 Rosegate Roseville, MN 55113 Phone: (612) 331-6910		Univar USA Inc. muniteam-west@univarsolutions.com 8201 S. 212th Street Kent, WA 98032 Phone: (253) 872-5068		Shannon Chemical Corporation dcflynn@shannonchem.com P.O. Box 376 Malvern, PA 19355 Phone: (610) 363-9090		Sterling Water Technologies, LLC badmsterling@coynechemical.com P.O. Box 602 Columbia, TN 38402-0602 Phone: (931) 540-1334	
Item	Quantity	Unit	Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price
1 Chlorine Manufacturer	6,000.00	Lb.	\$ 0.7500 Hawkins	\$ 4,500.00	\$ - No Bid	\$ - No Bid	\$ - No Bid	\$ - No Bid	\$ - No Bid	\$ - No Bid
2 Potassium Permanganate Manufacturer	4,000.00	Lb.	\$ 3.8300 Carus	\$ 15,320.00	\$ 3.5800 Not Listed	\$ 14,320.00	\$ 2.1100 Organic Industries	\$ 8,440.00	\$ - No Bid	\$ - No Bid
3 Hydrofluosilicic Acid Manufacturer	1,000.00	Lb.	\$ 0.6500 Hawkins	\$ 650.00	\$ - No Bid	\$ - No Bid	\$ - No Bid	\$ - No Bid	\$ - No Bid	\$ - No Bid
4 Blended Polyphosphate Manufacturer	15,000.00	Lb.	\$ 0.9800 Hawkins	\$ 14,700.00	\$ - No Bid	\$ - No Bid	\$ 2.2700 Shannon Chemical	\$ 34,050.00	\$ - No Bid	\$ - No Bid
AWARDED			\$ 19,850.00		\$ -		\$ 8,440.00		\$ -	
Remarks			Bid Bond		Bid Bond		Bid Bond		None	