BID TABULATION SHEET

Bid No. 2010-10

Water & Sewer Materials, Irrigation Materials, Marking Paint, RV Antifreeze & Powdered Chlorine

City of Huron 2:00 PM
Huron, South Dakota February 8, 2010
Northern Water Works Supply Milbank Winwater HD Supply Waterworks Northwest Pipe Fittings, Inc. Dakota Supply Group
1917 First Ave. North 102 East 22nd. Ave. 2101 East 54th. St North 41 Arizona Avenue N.W. 1409 K Ave.
Box 1070 Milbank, SD 57252 PO Box 85439 Huron, SD 57350 Sioux Falls, SD 57104
Bidders Fargo, ND 57107-1070 Sioux Falls, SD 57118-5439
Phone: (605) 352-8531 Phone (800) 660-5531
Phone: (800) 437-4362 Phone: (800) 843-3799 FAX: (605) 352-7072 (605) 336-2392
FAX: (701) 232-8129 FAX: (605) 339-2632
PROPOSAL No. 1
Schedules A thru J 17,039.71 | $ 15,254.45 || $ 17,286.11 | $ 17,211.25
PROPOSAL No. 2
Schedule K $ 9,642.06 9,834.00 | $ 9,894.27 | $ 11,246.97
PROPOSAL No. 3
Schedule L & M $ 1,066.60 $ 1,052.70 | $ 943.40
PROPOSAL No. 4
Schedule N $ 420.00 No Bid $ 440.20 | $ 404.40
Schedule O No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
PROPOSAL No. 6
Schedule P $ 330.00 No Bid No Bid $ 289.32
PROPOSAL No. 7
Schedule Q $ 4,167.84 | $ 3,601.86 No Bid No Bid
Awarded Totals| $ 15,054.98 | $ 9,240.00 | $ 817.50 | $ 3,160.34
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